
Induction & Welcome Activities 
W/c September 27th 2021 

 

Course BSc/FdSc Sport , Coaching and Fitness Studies Level 4 

School Health, Sport and Nutrition 

Day/Date/Time Programme Activities Location Staff and Resources 

Monday, September 
27th 
 
Time: 10.00-12.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Time: 13:00 – 15.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Time 15.00-15.30 
 

The introductory session is 
focused around ice-breaking 
activities, and developing 
relationships with other 
students.  
Within the session you will 
be able to share experiences, 
and also to gain some more 
information about being a 
university student. 
Your hopes and fear of 
University will be discussed, 
and ideas of ways to 
overcome these   
 
Team Building Activity 
You will also be given the 
opportunity to demonstrate 
or develop your team 
working/creative skills – with 
a group task which will able 
you to show some creative 
skills but also for you to get 
to know your fellow students 
further.  You will complete a 
UCB treasure hunt as part of 
the process. 
 
 
Review of Day 1  
Opportunity to ask any 
questions, and highlight the 
reaming week activities. 

 
MS105 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
MS206 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
MS206 

 
SCF Teaching Team 
(all) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
SCF – to offer 
support if needed 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
SCF Teaching Team 
(all) 
 

Tuesday, September 
28th  
 
Time 10.00 – 11.30 
 
 
Time 12.30 – 15:30 

Facility Introduction 
Students will use the HPC 
and gym to become familiar 
with the environment. 
Practical kit needed 
 
Review of Canvas, and UCB 
Portal. 
 

 
HPC Moss 
House, Moss 
House Gym  
 
 
MH232 

 

SCF Teaching Team 

(All) 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Module Page breakdown, 
and support resources – 
Including discussion boards, 
collaborations.  
  
Student dashboard Area 
 
Student emails – and how to 
develop professional emails 
 
CASE and Library pages. 
 
Timetable review, and 
expectations for teaching. 
 
SCF – Sports Kit 
 
Student Guild (TBC) 
 
Opportunity to ask questions 
 

Wednesday, 
September 29th 
 
All DAY 

WelcomeFest Moss 
House/McIntyre 
House 

 

Friday, October 1st  
 
Time: 10:00 – 14:00 
 
 

Sports Competition 
Multi sports activities 

Sports Hall 
Maltings 
 

SCF Teaching Team 
 
 
 
  


